ORDINANCE NO. & 33

ORDINANCE AMENDING THE CITY OF NEWTON CODE OF ORDINANCES,
TITLE XV, CHAPTER 150, BUILDING CODE, ELECTRICAL CODE,
PLUMBING CODE, FIRE CODE, AND MECHANICAL CODE FOR THE CITY
OF NEWTON

WHEREAS, the Newton City Council identified updating the building and fire codes as a priority project in the 2017-2019
City Council Goals, established on February 5, 2018;

WHEREAS, the Newton Building Trades Board reviewed the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Fire, and Mechanical Codes
and unanimously recommended approval at their May 2, 2018 of code updates;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NEWTON, IOWA:

Section 1. Title XV, 150.001 Building Code. Sections (A)-(E) is hereby modified by adding (underlined)
and deleting (strikethrough) as follows:

(A) Title. Pursuant to the authority of Iowa Code § 380.10, the International Building Code, 200915 Edition,
the International Residential Code, 200915 Edition, the International Energy Conservation Code, 200915
Edition, the International Existing Building Code, 2015 Edition and the Uniform Code for the Abatement of
Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, except as hereinafter amended by this section, are hereby adopted by
reference for the purpose of providing rules and regulations for the construction, alteration, removal,
demolition, equipment, use occupancy, location and maintenance of buildings and structures within the city.
The provisions of said codes, except as amended herein, shall be controlling in all matters contemplated therein
within the city. The provisions of this section shall be known as the “Building Code”.

(B) Copies on file. Official copies of said codes, including amendments as adopted, are on file in the office
of the Building Official.

(C) Available for public inspection. Copies of said codes, as amended, shall be kept available at the Building
Official’s office for public inspection.

(D) Conflicts and/or duplications. Provisions in the Building Code, to the contrary notwithstanding, nothing
in this section shall be deemed to repeal or invalidate by implication any provision of the ordinances of the city,
as amended, and where other ordinances of the city, such as the Zoning Ordinance, Subdivision Ordinance,
Plumbing Ordinance Code and Electrical Ordinance Code, shall, in any way, duplicate or conflict with the
provisions of the Building Code adopted under the terms of this section, the more strict provisions shall prevail.

(E) Amendments, to-thetnternational Building-Code-

(1) Amendments to International Building Code.

a. Section 101.1. Insert: City of Newton, lowa

b. Section 1612.3. Insert: City of Newton, Iowa

c. Section 308.6.4. Delete and replace with the following language:

308.6.4 Eight or Fewer persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A facility such as the
above within a dwelling unit and having eight or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall
be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential
Code.

d. Section 310.5 and 310.5.1, Delete and replace with the following language:

310.5 Residential Group R-3. Residential Group R-3 occupancies where the occupants are
primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R4 or I, including:

Buildings that do not contain more than two dwelling units.

Boarding houses (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants

Boarding houses (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants

Care facilities as identified in Sections 308.3.4 or 308.4.2 that provide accommodations for five
or fewer persons receiving care

Day care facilities as identified in section 308.6.4 located within single family dwellings with 8
or fewer persons receiving custodial care




h.

Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants

Congregate living facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants

Lodging houses with five or fewer guest rooms

310.5.1 Care facilities within a dwelling. Care facilities that are located within a single-family
dwelling are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code in accordance with
this section. 310.5.1.1 24-hour care facilities within a dwelling. Care facilities as identified in
sections 308.3.4 or 308.4.2 that provide accommodations for 5 or fewer persons receiving
custodial care in a single-family dwelling for 24-hours per day are permitted to comply with the
International Residential Code provided an automatic sprinkler system is installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.3 or Section P2904 of the International Residential Code.

310.5.1.2 Day care facilities within a dwelling. Day care facilities as identified in section
308.6.4 that provide custodial care for 8 or fewer persons for less than 24-hours per day in a
single-family dwelling are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code.

Exception: Day care facilities as identified in section 308.6.4 that provide custodial care for 16
or fewer persons for less than 24-hours per day in a single-family dwelling, and are registered
with the State of Iowa Department of Human Services as child development homes on or before
January 1, 2017, are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code.

Section 1009.2 Add item #11 with the following language: Components of exterior walking
surfaces shall be concrete, asphalt, or other approved hard surface.

Section 1010.1.6 Replace with the following language: For landings required by Section
1010.1.5 to be at the same elevation on each side of the door exterior landings at doors shall be
provided with frost protection.

Section 1013.3 Exit Sign Illumination. Exit signs shall use an LED lighting system and be
illuminated internally. Exit signs are required to have battery backup unless an onsite generator
is used. Luminance on the face of an exit sign shall have an intensity of not less than 5.0
footcandles (53.82 lux)

1. Exception: Tactile Exit signs required by Section 1013.4 need not be provided with
1llumination.

Delete Section 1013.5.

Delete Section 1013.6

Section 1030.5.3 Window Wells Drainage. All window wells shall be provided with
approved drainage.

(2) Amendments to International Residential Code.

a.

b.

C.

Section R101.1. Insert: City of Newton, Jowa

Section R302.13 Add Exception #5 as follows: Approved floor assemblies demonstrating
equivalent fire performance by an approved testing company showing length and time duration
for exposure to fire. It shall be defined by performance equivalent to 26 minutes using ASTM
E119 standard fire endurance testing with a superimposed load simulating a maximum load
condition (i.e. 100% design load)

Section R310.1 Insert Exception #2 as follows: For 1 and 2 family dwellings constructed under
the provisions of the 1988 Uniform Building Code or a previously adopted code (prior to 1988)

that are undergoing a renovation which requires an emergency escape window to an existing
basement without a compliant emergency escape window; an emergency escape window shall
not be required where the following conditions are met:

2.




1. An emergency escape window or door and the stairs to the floor above are placed a
distance apart equal to no less than one-half of the length of the maximum overall
diagonal dimension of the basement area.

2. Additional smoke alarms are installed in each area or room in the basement.

3. The common path of egress travel distance starting in the remote corner of the bedroom
does not exceed 25 feet.

4. The underside and supporting structure of the stair to the floors above is protected with
5 inch gypsum board or equivalent.

Note: This exception #2 does not apply to town homes.

d. Section R310.2.2 Add Exception #1 as follows: A landing may be provided to meet the
maximum sill height of forty-four (44) inches above the floor or landing provided. The landing
shall not be less than thirty-six (36) inches wide, not less than twelve (12) inches out from the
exterior wall, and not more than twenty-four (24) inches in height. The landing shall be
permanently affixed to the floor below or the wall under the window it serves.

e. Section R311.7.5.1 Add Exception #3 as follows: The dimension of the top and bottom riser of
a stair may vary up to 1-inch (25.4 mm) from the stairway riser dimension; however, in no case
shall the riser height exceed seven and three-quarter inches.

f Section R313.1 Replace with the following language:

Townhomes automatic fire sprinkler systems. An automatic residential fire sprinkler
system shall be installed in townhouses. Exceptions:

1. An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required where additions or
alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential
fire sprinkler system installed.

2. Townhouse structures that contain eight (8) or less dwelling units.

3. Townhouse structures less than eighteen thousand (18,000) square feet floor space,
exclusive of any garages.

g. Section R313.2 Replace with the following language:

One- and two-family dwelling automatic fire sprinkler systems. An automatic residential
fire sprinkler system shall be installed in one- and two-family dwellings. Exceptions:

1. An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required where additions or
alterations are made to existing buildings that are not already provided with an
automatic residential fire sprinkler system.

2. One- and two- family dwellings containing less than eight thousand (8,000) square feet

of floor space, excluding attached garages and other unenclosed areas.

h. Section R403.1.4.1. Exception #1, Replace with the following language: Protection for
detached garages and other accessory structures 1,000 square feet or less in size, with a
maximum height of fifteen (15) feet, located four (4) feet or more from a dwelling, attached
garage, or other principal structures, may be accomplished with a floating slab. The floating
slab shall include a thickened slab edge of a minimum twelve (12) inches thick. Six inches of
the thickened slab shall be below original grade and six inches shall be above finished grade.
The bottom portion of the thickened slab area shall be twelve (12) by twelve (12) inches. Three
#4 rebar shall be placed within the thickened edge continuous around the perimeter of the slab.
The floor shall be Portland cement concrete not less than four and one half (4 & '%) inches thick
with #3 rebar 30 inches on center over approved subgrade. Garage floor areas shall have all
sod and/or debris removed.

i.  Section R905.2.8.3 Sidewall flashing. Amended by deleting “continuous” as follows: Base
flashing against a vertical sidewall shall be eentinueus-orstep flashing and shall be not less
than 4 inches (102 mm) in height and 4 inches (102 mm) in width and shall direct water away
from the vertical sidewall onto the roof or into the gutter. Where siding is provided on the
vertical sidewall, the vertical leg of the flashing shall be continuous under the siding. Where
anchored masonry veneer is provided on the vertical sidewall, the base flashing shall be
provided in accordance with this section and counterflashing shall be provided in accordance
with Section R703.7.2.2. Where exterior plaster or adhered masonry veneer is provided on the
vertical sidewall, the base flashing shall be provided in accordance with this section and
Section R703.6.3.

-3-




j. Section M1601.4 Insert the following language:

Section M1601.4 Installation. Duct installation shall comply with sections M1601.4.1
through M1601.4.11

Section M1601.4.11. Air plenum and duct separation. Air plenums and ducts located in
floor and wall cavities shall be separated from unconditioned spaces by construction with
sufficient insulation to meet energy code requirements. These areas include but are not limited
to exterior walls, cantilevered floors, and floors above garages.

k. Section G2414.5.3 (403.5.4) Corrugated Stainless Steel Tubing. Replace with the following
language: Arc resistant corrugated stainless steel tubing shall be listed in accordance with
ANSI LC-1 (Optional Section 5.16)/CSA 6.26.

I, Section G2415.2 (404.2) CCST. Replace with the following language: Only CSST with an Arc
Resistant Jacket or Covering System listed in accordance with ANSI I.C-1 (Optional Section
5.16)/CSA 6.26-2016 shall be installed in accordance with the terms of its approval, the
conditions of listing, the manufacturer’s instructions and this code including electrical bonding
requirements in Section G2411. CSST shall not be used for through wall penetrations from the
point of delivery of the gas supply to the inside of the structure. CSST shall not be installed in
locations where subject to physical damage unless protected in an approved manner.

(3) Amendments to the Energy Code.

a. Section 408.2, Insert the following language: The Commissioning Agent shall be in no way
affiliated with the project’s design, installation or sale of products to avoid any conflict of

interest. The Commissioning Agent shall be accredited by an industry-recognized certification
program, to be determined by the AHJ.

Section 2. Title XV, 150.002 Electrical Code. Sections (A)-(ll) is hereby modified by adding (underlined)
and deleting (strikethrough) as follows:

(A) Title. Pursuant to the authority of Iowa Code § 380.10, the National Electrical Code, 204+14 Edition, as
amended by the state, except as hereinafter amended by this section, is hereby adopted by reference for the
purpose of providing minimum provisions to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public welfare by
regulating, licensing and controlling the design, installation, quality of materials, location and maintenance of
all electrical installations and uses within the city. The provisions of said Code, except as amended herein, shall
be controlling in all matters contemplated therein within the city. The provisions of this section shall be known
as the “Electrical Code”.

(B) Copies on file. An official copy of said Code, including amendments as adopted, is on file in the office
of the Building Official.

(C) Available for public inspection. A copy of said Code, as amended, shall be kept available at the Building
Official’s office for public inspection.

(D) Local amendments to the National Electrical Code. None.
(E) Scope.

(1) The provisions of the Electrical Code shall apply to the electrical conductors and equipment installed
within or on public and private structures and other premises; also the conductors that connect the installations
to a supply of electricity and other outside conductors adjacent to the premises; also mobile homes and travel
trailers.

(2) Additions to, alterations thereof, and repairs to existing electrical equipment, if covered by the
Electrical Code, shall comply with the provisions of the Electrical Code; and, further, the Electrical Inspector
may, when such additions, alterations or repairs are made, order further reasonable additions or alterations in a
building, structure or on premises, when a danger to life or property may result if such further additions or
alterations were not made.

4-




(3) Installations which were in compliance with the Electrical Code in existence at the time such
installations were made shall be presumed to be safe and proper, which presumption can be rebutted by
evidence that the installation may be dangerous to life or property.

(4) For the purposes of the Electrical Code, the term ELECTRICAL WORK shall apply to all uses,
installations, alterations, repairs, removals, replacements, connections, disconnections and maintenance of all
electrical equipment.

(5) The term ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT shall include all electrical materials, wiring, conductors,
fittings, apparatus, devices, appliances, fixtures, signs or parts thereof, used in electrical work.

(E) Application to moved buildings. Structures moved into or within the city shall comply with the
provisions of the Electrical Code for new structures.

(F) Existing buildings. If an existing building is damaged by fire, or otherwise altered in a manner to require
the replacement of 50% or more of the wiring equipment, the entire building shall be made to conform to the
requirements of the Electrical Code for new buildings. If the type of occupancy of an existing building is
partially or entirely changed, the electrical wiring shall be made to conform to the requirements of the Electrical
Code for the new type of occupancy.

(G) Conformity with standards. Conformity with the standards of the Underwriters’ Laboratories
Incorporated as approved by the United States of American Standards Institute shall be evidence of conformity
with approved standards for electrical equipment.

(H) Furnishing current prior to approval of wiring. No person or corporation generating current for electric
light, heat or power in the city shall connect its system or furnish current for electrical purposes to any building
or premises which has not been inspected and approved by the Electrical Inspector. Any person or corporation
shall, upon written notice from the Electrical Inspector to do so, immediately disconnect such building or
premise from its source of current.

(D) Violations. Tt shall be unlawful for any person to install, alter, repair, maintain, improve or use any
electrical equipment, or to perform any electrical work in the city, or cause the same to be done, contrary to or
in violation of any of the provisions of the Electrical Code.

(J) Violation and penalty. Any violation of this section, in addition to any other penalty provided, shall
constitute a municipal infraction and shall be punishable as provided in § 10.99(A) of this code of ordinances.

(K) Permits; required. No person shall perform any electrical work, nor install electrical equipment, in or
upon any building or property without first securing from the office of the Electrical Inspector a permit
therefor; nor shall any alteration or change be made in the wiring of any building; or in any electrical
installation therein or thereon, either before or after inspection, nor shall any electric current be connected to
any wires, or apparatus, without notifying the Electrical Inspector and securing a permit therefor. A separate
permit shall be obtained for each structure.

(L) Issuance. After proper application on forms provided by the Electrical Inspector, permits shall be issued
in the name of the person holding an active electrician’s license and the name of the firm the electrician
represents. All applications for electrical permits shall be signed by the licensed electrician, or the homeowner
doing homeowner’s own work.

(M) Non-transferable; permit restrictions. Permits are not transferable. Electrical work performed under
permits issued under the provisions of this section must be done under the direction of the electrician securing
such permit, the electrician’s firm or corporation.

(N) Double fee for failure to obtain permit before starting work.

(1) Except in emergency situations, as determined by the Electrical Inspector, where work for an electrical
permit is required by the Electrical Code is started or proceeded with by any person prior to obtaining a
required permit, the regular fees as specified in the Electrical Code for such work shall be doubled. The
payment of such double fee shall not relieve any persons from fully complying with the requirements of the
Electrical Code in the execution of the work, nor from any other penalties prescribed herein.

(2) No additional permits shall be issued to any person who owes the city the double fee described in this
section.

(O) Home owner. In cases where an owner-occupant of a single-family dwelling desires to install wiring or
electrical equipment or perform any electrical work in an existing owner-occupant single-family structure, the
owner-occupant may appear before the Electrical Inspector and show that the owner-occupant is competent to
do the specific work for which the owner-occupant desires an electrical permit, and after each showing, may
obtain an electrical permit by paying the proper fee. In cases of new construction of any scale, an owner-
occupant is not eligible to install wiring or electrical equipment or perform any electrical work. For purposes of

5-




this division (O), a SINGLE-FAMILY STRUCTURE shall mean a detached residence designed for or occupied
by one family only.

(P) Revocation of permit,; expiration of permit.

(1) Any permit required by the provisions of the Electrical Code may be revoked by the Electrical
Inspector upon the violation of any provisions of the Electrical Code.

(2) Every permit issued under the provisions of the Electrical Code shall expire by limitation and become
null and void if the work authorized by such permit is not commenced within 60 days from the date of issuance
of such permit, or if the work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is
commenced for a period of 120 days. Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit shall first be
obtained, and the fee therefor shall be one-half the amount required for a new permit for such work; provided
that, such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year.

(Q) Fees, fee exemption, re-inspection fees. There shall be paid to the city for the issuance of each electrical
permit a fee as established by resolution of the City Council. The schedule shall be periodically amended as
deemed appropriate by the Council.

(2) At the discretion of the Electrical Inspector, a re-inspection fee in the amount ef-$10 established by
resolution of the City Council may be charged to the holder of a permit if a re-inspection is necessary due to

permit holder calling for an inspection before the work is ready for inspection of if corrections must be made
that require re-inspection.

(R) Collection of fees for examinations—ticenses—certificates-and permits; refund of permit fees.

(1) All fees due to the city for examinations;licenses—certificates-and permits shall be collected in the
office of the Electrical Inspector and paid thereafter to the City of Newton Freasurer.

(2) If, within 30 days of the date of issuance, the holder of an electrical permit decides not to commence
the work described in such permit, the holder of the permit may, upon application to the Electrical Inspector, be
refunded that portion of the permit fee which is in excess of the basic fee $5. The refund of any fee of $5-er less
than the basic fee shall not be made.

(S) Inspections.

(1) It shall be the duty of the person to whom the permit was issued, for which a permit is required, to
notify the Electrical Inspector that said work is ready for inspection. The Electrical Inspector shall, without
undue delay, perform the required inspection.

(T) Covering or concealing work. No electrical work for which a permit is required shall be concealed in
any manner from access or sight until such work has been inspected and approved by the Electrical Inspector.

(U) Removal of covering. The Electrical Inspector shall have the authority to remove or cause to remove the
lath, plaster, boarding or other obstruction which may prevent the proper inspection of wires or electrical
equipment.

(V) Correcting defective work. When an electrical conductor is notified that defects exist in conductor’s
electrical work, the conductor shall make corrections promptly. Corrections shall be made within 30 days after
notification and, if not so made, the electrical contractor shall not be issued any other permits until such defects
are corrected and approval given by the Electrical Inspector.

(W) Annual inspection; notice of defects, failure to remedy defects. The Electrical Inspector is hereby
empowered to make an annual inspection of all electrical wires and equipment in the city and shall keep an
accurate record of inspections and the conditions of electrical equipment, and whenever it shall be ascertained
by inspection, as provided in this section, that any electrical installation or part thereof in any building is so
defective as to render the same dangerous to person or property, the Electrical Inspector shall at once cause
notice to be given served upon the owner or person in charge, or the occupant of the same to remedy the defects
within a reasonable time, to be stated in such notice, and if defects are not remedied within the time fixed by
such notice, the Electrical Inspector may cause the electric current to be disconnected from such building and
the electric current shall not again be turned on until all defects or improper conditions have been removed or
repaired in conformance with the provisions of the Electrical Code.




(X) Appointment of inspectors. The Electrical Inspector(s) shall be appointed by the City Administrator, or
designee, and be the Building Official or under supervision of the Building Official for the enforcement of the
Electrical Code and regulations of the city.

(Y) Electrical inspectors; powers, duties and authority. Inspectors shall have the following powers, duties
and authority.

(1) Entry and power to disconnect. Electrical inspectors shall have the right to enter upon any property
during reasonable hours in the discharge of their official duties and shall have the authority to cause the
disconnection of any wiring or equipment where such wiring or equipment is dangerous to life or property or
may interfere with the work of the Fire Department.

(2) Inspection authorized. The Electrical Inspectors are hereby authorized, directed and empowered to
inspect any and all electrical installations within the city, to condemn and order removed or remodeled and put
in proper and safe condition for the prevention of fire and the safety of life, all electrical heating and lighting
apparatus, motors, machinery, fixtures and connections, electrical equipment used in the utilization of electrical
current for light, heat or power purposes and to control the disposition and arrangements of the same so that
persons and property shall not be in danger therefrom.

(Z) Conflict of interest prohibited. The Electrical Inspector and inspector’s assistants shall not engage in the
business of the sale, installation or maintenance of electrical equipment, either directly or indirectly, and they
shall have no financial interest in any form engaged in such business in the city while holding office.

(AA) Electrician’s license required.

(1) No person shall engage in the activity, or represent himself or herself to the public as engaging in the
activity, of installing, altering, maintaining or repairing any electrical equipment within the scope of this section
unless such person shall have first obtained from the State of Iowa eity-an electrical jancontractor’s license.;







